

Drugs & Medications Bid No. 105-22DS - BID Tabulation

ITEM #	ITEM	DESCRIPTION	Henry Schein			McKesson			Bound Tree			AmeriSource Bergen			Notes
			Price	UOM	MFG/ Brand Name	Price	UOM	MFG/ Brand Name	Price	UOM	MFG/ Brand Name	Price	UOM	MFG/ Brand Name	
1	ACETAMINOPHEN CAPLETS	500mg 2/pk 250pk/bx	\$14.04	2/pk 250pk/bx	Henry Schein	\$13.74	250/BX	McKesson Corp	\$26.81	250/BX	Medique	\$10.19	1000/BTL	Major	**McKesson has been awarded due to packaging. 2 tablets per pkg with a total of 250.
2	ACETAMINOPHEN LIQUID SUSPENSION	325mg/10.15ml	\$175.17	100/CS	Pharmaceuticals Associates	\$31.44	30/CS	McKesson Pharmaceuticals	\$31.90	30/BX	Cardinal Health	No Bid			
3	ADENOSINE	3mg/ml, 12ml vial	\$68.33	10/PK	Mylan	\$38.06	1/EA	McKesson Pharmaceuticals	\$7.40	1/EA	HF Acquisition	No Bid			
4	ALBUTEROL	0.083% 2.5mg/ 3ml individually wrapped	\$7.26	30/BX	Ritedose Pharmaceuticals	\$3.87	25/BX	McKesson Pharmaceuticals	\$6.40	30/BX	Nephron	\$2.50	25/BX	Ritedose	
5	AMIODARONE	50mg/ml, 3ml vial	\$43.38	25/BX	Hikma	\$44.07	25/CT	McKesson Pharmaceuticals	\$46.89	25/PK	Other Manufacturer	\$38.35	10/PK	Mylan	**McKesson being awarded due to Henry Schein's vial being too similar to the Enalaprilil vial for patient safety.
6	ASPIRIN	81mg (1-1/4gr) unit dose, chewable tablets	\$0.88	36/BTL	New World Imports	\$0.93	1/BT	McKesson Corp	\$0.72	36/BTL	Geri-Care	\$0.64	36/BTL	Major	
7	ATROPINE SULFATE	0.1mg/ml, 10ml LifeShield syringe, individually boxed	\$157.96	10/BX	Pfizer	\$110.67	10/PK	IMS	\$92.95	10/BX	Pfizer	No Bid			
8	CALCIUM CHLORIDE	100mg/ml, 10ml LifeShield prefilled syringe, individually boxed	\$149.79	10/BX	Pfizer	\$111.47	10/CT	IMS	\$114.53	10/BX	Pfizer	No Bid			
9	CALCIUM GLUCONATE	10mg/ml, 10ml vial	\$344.85	25/BX	Fresenius	\$286.69	25/CT	McKesson Pharmaceuticals	\$305.90	25/PK	Other Manufacturer	No Bid			
10	CEFAZOLIN	1gm powder vial (ANCEF)	\$120.81	10/BX	Hikma	\$38.29	25/CT	McKesson Pharmaceuticals	\$31.90	25/BX	Other Manufacturer	\$27.50	25/BX	Apotex	
11	CEFTRIAZONE	1gm powder vial	\$24.01	1 EA	Hikma	\$37.20	25/BX	WG Critical Care LLC	\$2.80	1/EA	Sagent	\$3.85	1/EA	Sandoz	
12	CHILDREN'S BENADRYL	Diphenhydramine, Children's (12.5mg/5ml) 4oz	\$96.10	30/PK	Precision Dose	\$5.32	1/EA	McKesson Pharmaceuticals	\$2.75	1/BTL	Cardinal Health	\$1.22	1/BTL	Major	
13	CHILDREN'S IBUPROFEN	Ibuprofen, Oral (100mg/5ml) 4 oz	\$3.03	EA	Taro Pharmaceutical	\$3.91	1/EA	McKesson Corp	\$4.56	1/BTL	Cardinal Health	\$2.55	1/EA	Camber	
14	DEXTROSE 5%	IV injection solution, Dextrose 5% / Water 100mL, bag	\$3.26	EA	B Brown	\$6.96	4/PK	ICU Medical	\$2.37	1/EA	Baxter	No Bid			
15	DEXTROSE 10%	IV injection solution dextrose 10% / Water 250mL, bag	\$3.34	EA	B Brown	\$61.80	24/CS	B.Braun Medical	\$2.67	1/EA	B. Braun Medical	No Bid			
16	DILTIAZEM	5mg/ml, 5ml vial (refrigerate)	\$35.71	10/BX	Athenex Pharma	\$39.14	10/PK	McKesson Pharmaceuticals	\$46.50	10/BX	Hikma	No Bid			
17	DIPHENHYDRAMINE	25 mg CAP UD 100/bx	\$4.73	100/PK	Major	\$3.91	10/BX	McKesson Pharmaceuticals	\$4.75	100/BX	Cardinal Health	\$3.20	100 UD	Major	
17A		50mg/ml, 1ml vial	\$24.66	25/BX	Fresenius	\$26.32	25/BX	McKesson Pharmaceuticals	\$29.95	25/BX	Armas	\$18.80	25/BX	Armas	
18	ENALAPRILAT	1.25mg/ml, 1ml vial	\$75.25	10/BX	Hikma	\$55.29	10/CT	McKesson Pharmaceuticals	\$68.40	10/BX	Hikma	\$58.40	10/BX	Hikma	
19	EPINEPHRINE 1:1	1mg/ml, 1ml Vial 25/bx	\$498.67	25/PK	Par Sterile	\$24.09	1/EA	Healthfirst	\$531.25	25/PK	Cardinal Health	\$95.05	10/PK	BPI Labs	
20	EPINEPHRINE 1:10	0.1 mg/ml, 10ml LifeShield syringe, individually boxed	\$79.15	10/BX	Pfizer	\$100.14	10/PK	IMS	\$91.80	10/BX	Pfizer	No Bid			
21	ETOMIDATE	4mg/ml 10ml Vial	No Bid			No Bid			\$80.99	10/BX	Pfizer	No Bid			
22	FAMOTIDINE	20mg/50ml 50ml Piggyback Bag 48/cs	\$323.47	48/CS	Baxter	\$153.72	24/CT	McKesson Pharmaceuticals	\$312.17	48/CS	Baxter	No Bid			

Drugs & Medications Bid No. 105-22DS - BID Tabulation

ITEM #	ITEM	DESCRIPTION	Henry Schein			McKesson			Bound Tree			AmeriSource Bergen			Notes
			Price	Unit	Manufacturer	Price	Unit	Manufacturer	Price	Unit	Manufacturer	Price	Unit	Manufacturer	
23	FENTANYL	50mcg/ml 2 ml Vial with Safety Seal	\$49.28	25/BX	Pfizer	\$34.31	25/PK	McKesson Pharmaceuticals	\$109.99	25/BX	Hikma	No Bid			**Awarding to BoundTree and McKesson due to current license with BoundTree. This is until DEA license is approved with McKesson.
24	GLUCAGON EMERGENCY KIT	1mg w/1ml of diluting solution (Hyporet No. 7287)	\$368.78	EA	Eli Lilly	\$251.78	1/EA	McKesson Pharmaceuticals	\$152.00	1/EA	Other Manufacturer	\$197.90	1/EA	Amphastar	
25	HALOPERIDOL (IM ONLY)	5mg/ml 1ml vial 25/bx	\$27.43	25/BX	Mylan	\$52.64	10/CT	McKesson Pharmaceuticals	\$32.30	25/BX	Capital Wholesale Drug	\$24.20	25/BX	Mylan	
26	HEPARIN SODIUM	5,000/ml 1ml vial	\$33.31	25/BX	Hikma	\$88.71	25/BX	McKesson Pharmaceuticals	\$91.99	25/BX	Pfizer	\$28.00	25/BX	McKesson	
27	HYDROCOBALAMIN	5gm (Cyanokit)	\$1,150.67	EA	BTG International	\$987.66	1/EA	BTG International	\$1,046.36	1/EA	Cardinal Health	No Bid			
28	HYDROMORPHONE (Dilaudid)	2mg/ml 1ml vial	\$85.30	25/BX	Hikma	\$17.39	10/CT	McKesson Pharmaceuticals	\$124.99	25/BX	Hikma	No Bid			**Awarding to BoundTree and McKesson due to current license with BoundTree. This is until DEA license is approved with McKesson.
29	IBUPROFEN	200mg Tablet 2/pk, 50 pk/bx	\$17.82	2/PK, 250pk/bx	Henry Schein	\$4.48	100/BX	Medique	\$5.30	50/BX	Afasso	\$12.16	50/CT	Major	
30	INFLUENZA VACCINE (NO BRAND SPECIFIC)	0.5ml pre-filled syringes	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			\$181.30	10/BX	GSK	**Will not stock until Fall 2022
31	INFLUENZA VACCINE (NO BRAND SPECIFIC)	0.7ml pre-filled syringes	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			
32	IPRATROPIUM BROMIDE (ATROVENT)	.02%, 0.5mg/2.5ml Inhalation Solution individually packaged	\$6.21	30/BX	Nephron	\$4.16	25/CT	McKesson Pharmaceuticals	\$10.60	30/BX	Nephron	\$2.48	25/BX	Ritedose	
33	KETAMINE	100mg/ml, 5ml vial	\$101.89	10/BX	Pfizer	\$132.69	10/CT	McKesson Pharmaceuticals	\$118.99	10/BX	Pfizer	No Bid			**Have to award to Bound Tree due to current DEA license established with Bound Tree
34	KETOROLAC (IV & IM)	15mg/ml 1ml Vial 25/ct	\$34.25	25/PK	Almaject	\$30.04	25/CT	McKesson Pharmaceuticals	\$92.99	25/BX	Pfizer	No Bid			
35	LEVETIRACETAM (Keppra)	100mg/ml 5ml vial	\$20.21	10/BX	Armas	\$28.54	10/CT	McKesson Pharmaceuticals	\$23.99	10/BX	Cardinal Health	No Bid			
36	LEVOPHED	0.1% 1mcg/ml 4ml vial	\$59.19	10/BX	Breckenridge	No Bid			\$251.70	10/BX	Pfizer	No Bid			
37	LIDOCAINE HCL	20mg/ml 5ml LifeShield Syringe, individually boxed	\$47.00	10/BX	Pfizer	\$143.06	25/CT	IMS	\$61.99	10/BX	Pfizer	No Bid			
38	MAGNESIUM SULFATE	0.5gm/ml 10ml vial	\$62.19	25/BX	Fresenius	\$54.08	25/CT	McKesson Pharmaceuticals	\$68.50	25/BX	Other Manufacturer	No Bid			
39	MIDAZOLAM	5mg/ml 2ml vial	\$17.27	10/BX	Pfizer	\$13.62	10/BX	McKesson Pharmaceuticals	\$18.60	10/BX	Pfizer	No Bid			**Awarding to BoundTree and McKesson due to current license with BoundTree. This is until DEA license is approved with McKesson.
40	NALOXONE	1mg/ml 2ml LifeShield prefilled syringe, individually boxed	\$178.82	10/BX	IMS	\$347.22	10/CT	IMS	\$230.99	10/CS	IMS	\$192.50	10/BX	INTL Medication	
41	NASAL SPRAY DECONGESTANT (Afrin)	Single Use	\$6.70	EA	Afrin	\$1.64	1/EA	McKesson Corp	\$1.35	1/EA	Cardinal Health	No Bid			
42	NITROGLYCERIN	50mg (200mcg/ml) Dextrose 5%, 250ml, Glass	\$303.13	12/CS	Baxter	\$284.28	12/CS	Baxter	\$280.50	12/CS	Baxter	No Bid			
43	NITROGLYCERIN TABLETS	0.4MG 25/BT	\$16.00	25/BTL, 4BTL/BX	Alvogen	\$54.93	4/CT	McKesson Pharmaceuticals	\$90.16	25/BTL, 4BTL/BX	Cardinal Health	\$8.95	4x25	Glenmark	
44	ODANSETRON (ZOFRAN)	4mg ODT (Blister Pack)	\$2.68	3x10/UD	Sun Pharmaceuticals	\$3.72	30/BX	McKesson Pharmaceuticals	\$5.55	30/BX	Other Manufacturer	\$3.22	3x10/UD	Rising	

Drugs & Medications Bid No. 105-22DS - BID Tabulation

ITEM	ITEM	DESCRIPTION	Henry Schein			McKesson			Bound Tree			AmeriSource Bergen			Notes
45	ONDANSETRON	2mg/ml 2ml vial	\$9.74	25/BX	Apotex	\$12.88	25/CT	McKesson Pharmaceuticals	\$8.95	25/BX	Cardinal Health	No Bid			
46	PROMETHAZINE	25mg/ml 1ml Vial	\$75.92	25/BX	Hikma	\$52.88	25/PK	McKesson Pharmaceuticals	\$51.45	25/BX	Hikma	No Bid			
47	ROCURONIUM	10mg/ml 10ml vial	\$48.47	10/BX	Almaject	\$81.96	10/CT	Pfizer	\$98.50	10/BX	Pfizer	\$33.70	10 x 5 ml	X-Gen	**Amerisource priced at 5ml instead of 10ml
48	SODIUM BICARBONATE	8.4%, 50mEq/50ml,prefilled syringe, individually boxed	\$195.72	10/BX	Pfizer	\$114.33	10/BX	Pfizer	\$197.99	10/PK	IMS	No Bid			
49	SODIUM CHLORIDE	0.9% IV Solution 100ml	\$2.53	EA	Baxter	\$264.57	96/CS	Baxter	\$3.85	1/EA	B. Braun Medical	No Bid			
50	SOL-U-MEDROL	125mg/2ml "Act-O-Vial"	\$278.61	25/PK	Pfizer	\$278.56	25/PK	Pfizer	\$252.50	25/BX	Pfizer	\$243.40	25/BX	Pfizer	
51	SUCCINYLCHOLINE	20mg/ml 10 ml vial	\$135.84	25/BX	Camber Pharmaceuticals	\$439.76	25/CT	McKesson Pharmaceuticals	\$280.99	25/BX	Cardinal Health	\$93.50	10/BX	Somerset	
52	TRANEXAMIC ACID (TXA)	100mg/ml 10ml vial	\$35.86	10/BX	Apotex	\$84.23	10/CT	McKesson Pharmaceuticals	\$55.80	10/BX	Cardinal Health	\$42.90	10/BX	Provepharm	